
Official Bid Results for Jackson County, Texas

2019 Annual Supply Contract of Seal Coating with Equipment and Application

1

Material Application Total Rank Material Application Total Rank Material Application Total Rank

3.08 0.39 3.47 1 2.70 0.39 3.09 0.00

3.08 0.39 3.47 1 2.70 0.39 3.09 0.00

3.08 0.39 3.47 1 2.70 0.39 3.09 0.00

3.08 0.39 3.47 1 2.70 0.39 3.09 0.00

Material Application Total Rank Material Application Total Rank Material Application Total Rank

0.00 0.00 0.00

0.00 0.00 0.00

0.00 0.00 0.00

0.00 0.00 0.00

Precinct #1

Precinct #2

Precinct #3

Precinct #4

Seal Coat CWE-2

Unit: Gallons

Total Quantity: 12,000

NO BID NO BID NO BID

Precinct #1

Precinct #2

Precinct #3

Precinct #4

Seal Coat AC-5 or AC-10

Unit: Gallons

Total Quantity: 88,000

1

Faltisek

2

K-C LEASE DBA MATAGORDA CONSTRUCTION 

MATERIALS*

Bid Results FY 2019 01/10/2019



Official Bid Results for Jackson County, Texas

2019 Annual Supply Contract of Seal Coating with Equipment and Application

2

Material Application Total Rank Material Application Total Rank Material Application Total Rank

0.00 0.00 0.00

0.00 0.00 0.00

0.00 0.00 0.00

0.00 0.00 0.00

Material Application Total Rank Material Application Total Rank Material Application Total Rank

3.13 0.25 3.38 1 0.00 0.00

3.13 0.25 3.38 1 0.00 0.00

3.13 0.25 3.38 1 0.00 0.00

3.13 0.25 3.38 1 0.00 0.00

* have 13' oil distributor, not the required 20'

Precinct #1

Precinct #2

Precinct #3

Precinct #4

Seal Coat MC-30

Unit: Gallons

Total Quantity: 15,000

1

Faltisek

Precinct #1

Precinct #2

Precinct #3

Precinct #4

Seal Coat RC-250

Unit: Gallons

Total Quantity: 10,000

NO BID NO BID NO BID

Bid Results FY 2019 01/10/2019


